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Health and Human Services committee, 


It is a privilege to be able to testify today and relate my experience in treating vaccine injured 
North Dakotans from across state lines between Iowa and Nebraska  My practice based out of 
Northwest Iowa has seen several North Dakotans come physically to my clinic in Spirit Lake, 
Iowa for treatment of vaccine injuries.   


One of these seminal cases involves a retired pharmacist who had multiple vaccines for 
COVID19, after the third vaccine she experienced a hypertensive crisis requiring emergency 
medical attention and was subsequently diagnosed in the following weeks with monoclonal 
gammopathy of undetermined significance (MGUS).  


In treating this patient from Northwest North Dakota, I employed the North Dakota CARES ACT 
Grant innovations in medical countermeasures for pandemic viruses including spike protein 
mediated disease that Agriculture Commissioner Doug Goehring funded for Dr. Leslie Link and 
I to develop, broadcast and teach to everyone possible across the northern plains.


My patient's laboratory values from Mayo Clinic regarding MGUS had reached the threshold of 
concern for the development of multiple myeloma by the time she saw me in Iowa.  The 
program of therapy that I designed for this retired pharmacist has now reversed the anti-body 
derangement.  We continue to monitor her condition and have her in a regular program of mild 
hyperbaric therapy combined with primary glutathione amino acid precursors support, nitric 
oxide vascular conditioning agents and spirulina.  Spirulina is a single celled organism that is 
used by NASA in the space station program.  Spirulina added to CA2963131, a Canadian 
patented anti-viral system with beet root powder has been used in my practice to reverse 
cognitive decline/dementia and ejection fraction suppression after COVID19 infection and 
vaccination.


in this context that I feel that presented bill is extremely important for North Dakota citizens.  
Setting up the patient registry of injured individuals from North Dakota injured by vaccines for 
SARS CoV2 to include individuals with history of death is very important.  I might add that 
there will need to be autopsy data including blood draws of spike protein levels within those 
who died or had serious adverse events.  Autopsy documentation of the multifocal clotting 
seen in death by mRNA technology would be important but also, histopathology on cardiac 
electrical nodes and purkinje fibers would be paramount in autopsy diagnosis of mRNA biotech 
mediated “Sudden Adult Death Syndrome” - which was never taught at UND SOM as any sort 
of clinical syndrome to be aware of in my tenure as the Chairman of Radiology from 
2006-2019.  


From within the radiology community, we are finding a signature diagnosis of late gadolinium 
enhancement in cardiac MRI studies as a marker of vaccine-based injury to the myocardium 
from the spike protein bearing biotechnology and genetic manipulation system.  It will be 
important for the Department of Health and Human Services to actually track this data on 
behalf of North Dakota citizens.  I heard through my networks in medicine that the University of 
Minnesota did Cardiac MRIs on all of their football players after their vaccine/niotech role out in 
2021.  


Additionally, I might add that by involving the trial attorneys of North Dakota, those North 
Dakotans harmed by the biotech mRNA products could have a window of opportunity for legal 
recourse against the manufacturers of these products causing harm to the health of North 
accordance.




Medical liability of government entity section is extremely important.  Our government agencies 
from the federal system down to even county based public health systems have participated in 
this global racketeering scheme through the unethical distribution of this vaccine biotech 
genetic engineering system into the human body and population.  It would appear that the 
state legislature is the only entity that has the power to protect the people with laws such as 
this.


When Governor Bergman joined several other Governor's in requesting an end to the 
mandates for the military, it seems to me that that the end of mandates for North Dakotans 
should have come with that declaration. We are all basically constricted into a global war 
based on a bioweapons platform destroying mitochondria, therefore we are all veterans at 
some level. Johnson and Johnson got away with having the state of North Dakota pay for its 
GAIN OF FUNCTION product with their live attenuated GMO of an adenovirus containing Spike 
Protein.


Our medical military readiness is dependent on this end of mandates in America and North 
Dakota now more than ever in the practice of medicine and nursing.  We have suffered many 
losses occupationally and this biowarfare/psychological operations system. I brought forth 
concerns for just what we have been though in an open letter to the Washington state 
legislature in February 2019; foreshadowing fairly well where we are politically in terms of 
subterfuge and treasonous actions between enemies within America and affiliates in the racket 
between Wuhan China and even the bio-labs of Ukraine.


Unequivocally I am for this bill and would only suggest that we recodify these mRNA products 
as genetic modification agents and not as vaccines as this is the terminology has shielded 
these biotechnology products from liability.  These are far from technological prior art in 
development of vaccines and therefore should not be called vaccines.  


Lastly, my gravest concern is now in the development of Mad Cow disease of rapid onset after 
COVID mRNA bioweapon injection.  The 1989 Bioweapons Anti-Terrorism Act of the 101st 
Congress would define Pfizer and Moderna corporations as bioweapons manufacturers.  


Thank you for your time and attention.


Appreciatively,


Edward F. Fogarty, MD


2019 Open Letter to the State of Washington embedded here:

https://www.ndlegis.gov/assembly/67-2021/testimony/HHUMSER-1306-20210119-1626-F-
FOGARTY_EDWARD.pdf


https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/?term=late+gadolinium+enhancement+vaccine

56 Articles in the National Library of Medicine PUB MED Database


https://www.ijvtpr.com/index.php/IJVTPR/article/view/66
Mad Cow Disease in 26 person case series from France - shortly after mRNA biotech 
exposure.


https://www.mdpi.com/1467-3045/44/3/73

DNA incorporation of mRNA sequence above.
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