
Chairwoman Larsen and members of the committee, my name is Dr. Andrew Myer. I am here to 
provide neutral testimony on the impacts of SB2128. I am a tenured criminal justice professor 
and a research fellow with the University of Cincinnati Corrections Institute. I have over 20 
years of experience evaluating and conducting research in correctional settings. I have worked 
with over a dozen state correctional agencies and dozens of community correctional agencies 
nationwide. I have published over a dozen peer-reviewed academic articles, most of which relate 
to the correctional system. I have also written over a hundred technical reports to assist 
correctional agencies in reducing recidivism.  

I believe it is critically important to examine the impacts of proposed legislation from a neutral 
scientific perspective. To that end, I would like to present you with an overview of what we 
know about the impacts of passing mandatory minimums, just as SB2128 proposes, on crime 
(community safety) and prison safety.  

First, research demonstrates that mandatory minimum laws do not reduce crime in our 
communities. Empirical research has (1) evaluated changes in crime levels within a state over 
time (i.e., pre and post-testing) as well as (2) compared states that pass this law to states that do 
not pass these laws (Roman, 2022; Sundt & Boppre, 2021; The Council on Criminal Justice, 
2023; Tonry, 2013; Tonry, 2014; Tonry, 2016; Tonry, 2017; Tonry, 2019). The most rigorous 
methodological studies consistently show these laws fail to reduce crime.  

As a professor of criminal justice, I realize that this finding is often surprising to people. How 
could locking people up not reduce crime? Mandatory minimum laws try to impact behaviors via 
deterrence and incapacitation. Three things are necessary for deterrence to work—certainty (a 
person will be caught), celerity (the person will be punished quickly), and severity (the 
punishment is appropriate for the crime).  

It is not easy to establish accountability for crimes via certainty in punishment. This is because 
not all crimes are solved, and the clearance rates for crimes fluctuate and are influenced by many 
factors. Let’s focus on violent crimes. For context, in 2023, the clearance rate for violent crime in 
North Dakota was an impressive 57%, a ten-year high up from a low of 49% in 2017 (FBI Crime 
Data Explorer, 2024). Robbery and aggravated assault clearance rates are routinely around 30-
40% clearance rates. Thus, one cannot guarantee certainty in punishment, reducing any 
deterrable impact of a law. Furthermore, celerity is challenging to manipulate because our courts 
are designed to protect due process rights. This leaves one element that we can manipulate more 
readily—severity. This is concerning because we already have historically lengthy sentences, 
and the cost of increasing sentence lengths is substantial. Unsurprisingly, a meta-analysis of 40 
studies of deterrent-based approaches demonstrated no consistent reductions in recidivism (Pratt 
et al. 2006). 

One could argue that removing those convicted under mandatory minimums from society should 
impact crime. To calculate the impact that incarceration has on crime, one must account for 
many factors, including the number of crimes that would have been committed had the 
individual been in society. These are not static variables; their impact changes over time and is a 
function of age, offense, and substance use/abuse history, to name a few. Empirical research 



from criminologists, sociologists, and economists estimates that crime could be reduced by 10% 
by doubling the prison population (see Spelman, 2000).  

This takes me to my second empirical observation is that mandatory minimum sentencing 
practices are costly. Research has shown that defendants facing longer sentences often reject 
plea deals and select trials. Thus, more trials, longer trials, and more court resources are needed 
(see Tsuchimoto & Dusek, 2009). In addition, longer stays in prison result in more taxpayer 
dollars spent on longer prison stays (see Shepherd, 2002)—which do not lead to reductions in 
crime. These problems are further exacerbated by limiting parole. Research on parole shows 
significant reductions in recidivism compared to those who max out their sentences (Ostermann, 
2012, 2013, 2015; Schlager & Robbins 2008; Vito, Higgins, & Tewksbury, 2017). These 
findings, along with the findings related to a lack of impact on crime, suggest that there is a 
minimal return on one’s investment.  

My third point to the committee is that mandatory minimums impact prison safety. Since 
mandatory minimums were introduced, this has been a consistent finding (see Memory et al. 
1999). Increasing the length of time served while restricting opportunities for release directly 
impacts the functioning of prisons, not only in terms of cost but also in terms of safety. Research 
on mandatory minimums has demonstrated that those individuals sentenced under mandatory 
minimum laws have more disciplinary infractions for violent, property, drugs, and disorderly 
misconduct compared to those not sentenced under mandatory minimum laws. This finding was 
held from the first month in prison to 4 years later (Bales et al. 2012). In addition, mandatory 
minimums can lead to overcrowding. This makes an already difficult job even more dangerous 
for correctional workers. Overcrowding has been empirically demonstrated to make prisons more 
dangerous; violence in prisons increases for staff and inmates, which impacts their physical and 
mental health; rehabilitation, healthcare, and education services are diminished because of 
security concerns (see Baggio et al. 2020; MacDonald, 2018). Many states that experience 
overcrowding conditions are subject to lawsuits (Guetzkow & Schoon, 2015). 

In summary, a review of the empirical research demonstrates that mandatory minimums (1) do 
not reduce crime, (2) are exceedingly costly to state budgets, and (3) create prisons that are more 
dangerous for staff and inmates.  

I thank the committee for their time. I am happy to answer any questions from the committee.  
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